

<u>Description</u>	<u>Size</u>	<u>QTY</u> <u>Case</u>	<u>Vendor</u>	
			<u>Contract Paper Group</u>	<u>WCP Solutions</u>
Blue Boise Fireworks 20/50# text	8.5 x 14 Fascopy/Millequal	1	\$ 55.50	Domtar \$ 62.00
Sea Blue ecopy bright 60# text	8.5 x 11 Bright Hue	1	\$ 63.30	Earthchoice opaque \$ 52.50
Sea Blue ecopy bright 60# text	11x17 Bright Hue	1	\$ 64.30	Earthchoice Opaque \$ 55.35
Buff mulitpurpose 20/50 text	8.5 x 11 Fascopy/Millequal	12	\$ 41.47	Domtar \$ 45.40
Buff mulitpurpose 20/50 text	8.5 x 14 Fascopy/Millequal	2	\$ 55.50	NO BID
Buff mulitpurpose 20/50 text	11x17 Fascopy/Millequal	1	\$ 47.30	Domtar \$ 47.85
Buff multipurpose 65# cover	8.5 x 11 90# index cardstock 250/cs, Boise or mill equiv.	1	\$ 44.47	NO BID
Green luminous lime 60# text	8.5 x 11 Ultra Lime, brite hue	4	\$ 63.30	Domtar \$ 68.00
green pastel ecopy pastel 20/50# text	8.5 x 11 Fascopy/Millequal	1	\$ 41.47	Domtar \$ 45.40

Grey ecopy pastel 20/50 text	11x17 Fascopy/Millequal	1	\$ 47.30	Domtar	\$ 47.85
Ivory multipurpose boise fireworks	8.5 x 14 Fascopy/Millequal	12	\$ 55.50	Domtar	\$ 62.00
Ivory multipurpose ecopy pastel	11x17 Fascopy/Millequal	1	\$ 47.30	Domtar	\$ 47.85
Ivory multipupose 65# cover	8.5 x 11 90# index cardstock, 250/cs, Boise or mill equiv.	1	\$ 44.49	Earthchoice opaque	\$ 53.40
Orange ultra ecopy bright 60# text	8.5 x 11 brite hue	2	\$ 63.30	Domtar	\$ 68.00
Orange ultra ecopy bright 60# text	11x17 brite hue	1	\$ 64.30	Domtar	\$ 70.85
Orange Gold ecopy pastel 20/50# text	8.5 x 11 Goldenrod, fascopy mill equiv	3	\$ 41.47	Domtar	\$ 45.40
Orange gold boise fireworks 20/50 # text	8.5 x 14 Goldenrod, fascopy mill equiv	1	\$ 55.50	Domtar	\$ 60.80
Orange gold boise fireworks 20/50# text	11x17 Goldenrod, fascopy mill equiv	1	\$ 47.30	Domtar	\$ 47.85
Orange gold ecopy pastel 65# cover	8.5 x 11 90# index cardstock, 250/cs, boise or mill equiv.	2	\$ 44.47		NO BID
Purple Orchid ecopy pastel 20/50 Text	8.5 x 11 fascopy mill equiv	1	\$ 41.47	Domtar	\$ 46.50
Purple Orchid ecopy pastel	8.5 x 11	1	\$ 44.47		NO BID

65# cover	90# index cardstock, boise mill equiv				
Red energetic ecopy bright 60# text	8.5 x 11 Ultra Lava, bright hue	2	\$ 63.30	Domtar	\$ 68.00
Tan boise fireworks 20/50# text	8.5 x 14 Ivory fascopy mill equiv	3	\$ 55.50		NO BID
Tan ecopy pastel 20/50# text	11x17 fascopy mill equiv	2	\$ 47.30	Domtar	\$ 47.85
Yellow Canary ecopy pastel 20/50# text	8.5 x 11 fascopy mill equiv	4	\$ 41.47	Domtar	\$ 45.40
Yellow canary boise fireworks 20/50# text	8.5 x 14 fascopy mill equiv	1	\$ 55.50	Domtar	\$ 60.80
Yellow solar flare ecopy bright 65# text	8.5 x 11 Ultra Lemon, 60#	4	\$ 63.30	Domtar Hots	\$ 68.70
Yellow solar flare ecopy bright 65# text	8.5 x 14 Ultra Lemon, 60#	1	NO BID		NO BID
Yellow Solar flare ecopy bright 65# text	11x17 Ultra Lemon, 60#	1	\$ 64.30		NO BID