

Fair Shirts  
#661175  
29-May-15

Description	QTY	Size	Vendor		C & C Design		D&L Plastic Screening		OrchidUniform Sales		Express Press		SP Design Mfg	
			Eagle Eye Promotions 17-Jul-15		19-Jun-15		14 days		15 days		19 days		14 days	
Delivery														
Fair Team Shirts, V neck			each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total
	12	Medium	\$ 10.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 78.00	\$ 3.24	\$ 38.88	\$ 8.87	\$ 106.44	\$ 7.76	\$ 93.12	\$ 6.47	\$ 77.64
	13	Large	\$ 10.00	\$ 130.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 84.50	\$ 3.24	\$ 42.12	\$ 8.87	\$ 115.31	\$ 7.76	\$ 100.88	\$ 6.47	\$ 84.11
	12	Xlarge	\$ 10.00	\$ 120.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 78.00	\$ 3.24	\$ 38.88	\$ 8.87	\$ 106.44	\$ 7.76	\$ 93.12	\$ 6.47	\$ 77.64
	2	XXLarge	\$ 10.00	\$ 20.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 3.24	\$ 6.48	\$ 8.87	\$ 17.74	\$ 7.76	\$ 15.52	\$ 6.47	\$ 12.94
				<b>\$ 390.00</b>		<b>\$ 258.50</b>		<b>\$ 126.36</b>		<b>\$ 345.93</b>		<b>\$ 302.64</b>		<b>\$ 252.33</b>
Fair Team Shirts, Crew neck														
	2	Small	\$ 7.65	\$ 15.30	\$ 6.50	\$ 13.00	\$ 3.28	\$ 6.56	\$ 8.87	\$ 17.74	\$ 4.93	\$ 9.86	\$ 3.73	\$ 7.46
	7	Large	\$ 7.65	\$ 53.55	\$ 6.50	\$ 45.50	\$ 3.28	\$ 22.96	\$ 8.87	\$ 62.09	\$ 4.93	\$ 34.51	\$ 3.73	\$ 26.11
	4	Xlarge	\$ 7.65	\$ 30.60	\$ 6.50	\$ 26.00	\$ 3.28	\$ 13.12	\$ 8.87	\$ 35.48	\$ 4.93	\$ 19.72	\$ 3.73	\$ 14.92
	2	XXLarge	\$ 7.65	\$ 15.30	\$ 9.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 3.28	\$ 6.56	\$ 8.87	\$ 17.74	\$ 4.93	\$ 9.86	\$ 3.73	\$ 7.46
				<b>\$ 114.75</b>		<b>\$ 102.50</b>		<b>\$ 49.20</b>		<b>\$ 133.05</b>		<b>\$ 73.95</b>		<b>\$ 55.95</b>
Superintendent Shirts														
	4	Small	\$ 12.97	\$ 51.88	\$ 9.15	\$ 36.60	\$ 8.48	\$ 33.92	\$ 7.65	\$ 30.60	\$ 9.12	\$ 36.48	\$ 7.93	\$ 31.72
	16	Medium	\$ 12.97	\$ 207.52	\$ 9.15	\$ 146.40	\$ 8.48	\$ 135.68	\$ 7.65	\$ 122.40	\$ 9.12	\$ 145.92	\$ 7.93	\$ 126.88
	10	Large	\$ 12.97	\$ 129.70	\$ 9.15	\$ 91.50	\$ 8.48	\$ 84.80	\$ 7.65	\$ 76.50	\$ 9.12	\$ 91.20	\$ 7.93	\$ 79.30
	22	Xlarge	\$ 12.97	\$ 285.34	\$ 9.15	\$ 201.30	\$ 8.48	\$ 186.56	\$ 7.65	\$ 168.30	\$ 9.12	\$ 200.64	\$ 7.93	\$ 174.46
	2	XXLarge	\$ 16.00	\$ 32.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 22.00	\$ 8.48	\$ 16.96	\$ 7.65	\$ 15.30	\$ 9.12	\$ 18.24	\$ 7.93	\$ 15.86
	1	XXXLarge	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.48	\$ 8.48	\$ 7.65	\$ 7.65	\$ 9.12	\$ 9.12	\$ 7.93	\$ 7.93
				<b>\$ 722.44</b>		<b>\$ 508.80</b>		<b>\$ 466.40</b>		<b>\$ 420.75</b>		<b>\$ 501.60</b>		<b>\$ 436.15</b>
Superintendent western shirts														
	2	Small	\$ 21.50	\$ 43.00	\$ 15.60	\$ 31.20	\$ 9.82	\$ 19.64	\$ 10.93	\$ 21.86	\$ 16.06	\$ 32.12	\$ 15.03	\$ 30.06
	14	Medium	\$ 21.50	\$ 301.00	\$ 15.60	\$ 218.40	\$ 9.82	\$ 137.48	\$ 10.93	\$ 153.02	\$ 16.06	\$ 224.84	\$ 15.03	\$ 210.42
	12	Large	\$ 21.50	\$ 258.00	\$ 15.60	\$ 187.20	\$ 9.82	\$ 117.84	\$ 10.93	\$ 131.16	\$ 16.06	\$ 192.72	\$ 15.03	\$ 180.36
	14	Xlarge	\$ 21.50	\$ 301.00	\$ 15.60	\$ 218.40	\$ 9.82	\$ 137.48	\$ 10.93	\$ 153.02	\$ 16.06	\$ 224.84	\$ 15.03	\$ 210.42
	3	XXLarge	\$ 21.50	\$ 64.50	\$ 20.00	\$ 60.00	\$ 9.82	\$ 29.46	\$ 10.93	\$ 32.79	\$ 16.06	\$ 48.18	\$ 15.03	\$ 45.09
				<b>\$ 967.50</b>		<b>\$ 715.20</b>		<b>\$ 441.90</b>		<b>\$ 491.85</b>		<b>\$ 722.70</b>		<b>\$ 676.35</b>
Crew T-Shirts														
	300	Small	\$ 3.52	\$ 1,056.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 1,950.00	\$ 2.43	\$ 729.00	\$ 3.77	\$ 1,131.00	\$ 4.11	\$ 1,233.00	\$ 3.11	\$ 933.00
	400	Medium	\$ 3.52	\$ 1,408.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 2,600.00	\$ 2.43	\$ 972.00	\$ 3.77	\$ 1,508.00	\$ 4.11	\$ 1,644.00	\$ 3.11	\$ 1,244.00
	250	Large	\$ 3.52	\$ 880.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 1,625.00	\$ 2.43	\$ 607.50	\$ 3.77	\$ 942.50	\$ 4.11	\$ 1,027.50	\$ 3.11	\$ 777.50
	250	Xlarge	\$ 3.52	\$ 880.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 1,625.00	\$ 2.43	\$ 607.50	\$ 3.77	\$ 942.50	\$ 4.11	\$ 1,027.50	\$ 3.11	\$ 777.50
	25	XXLarge	\$ 6.34	\$ 158.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2.43	\$ 60.75	\$ 3.77	\$ 94.25	\$ 4.11	\$ 102.75	\$ 3.11	\$ 77.75
	20	XXXLarge	\$ 7.32	\$ 146.40	\$ 9.00	\$ 180.00	\$ 2.43	\$ 48.60	\$ 3.77	\$ 75.40	\$ 4.11	\$ 82.20	\$ 3.11	\$ 62.20
				<b>\$ 4,528.90</b>		<b>\$ 8,205.00</b>		<b>\$ 3,025.35</b>		<b>\$ 4,693.65</b>		<b>\$ 5,116.95</b>		<b>\$ 3,871.95</b>

Mud Run Shirts	40	Small	\$ 5.55	\$ 222.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 260.00	\$ 2.08	\$ 83.20	\$ 4.15	\$ 166.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 159.20	\$ 2.77	\$ 110.80
	60	Medium	\$ 5.55	\$ 333.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 390.00	\$ 2.08	\$ 124.80	\$ 4.15	\$ 249.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 238.80	\$ 2.77	\$ 166.20
	60	Large	\$ 5.55	\$ 333.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 390.00	\$ 2.08	\$ 124.80	\$ 4.15	\$ 249.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 238.80	\$ 2.77	\$ 166.20
	40	Xlarge	\$ 5.55	\$ 222.00	\$ 6.50	\$ 260.00	\$ 2.08	\$ 83.20	\$ 4.15	\$ 166.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 159.20	\$ 2.77	\$ 110.80
				<b>\$ 1,110.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,300.00</b>		<b>\$ 416.00</b>		<b>\$ 830.00</b>		<b>\$ 796.00</b>		<b>\$ 554.00</b>
Commissioner Shirts														
	4	Large	\$ 12.97	\$ 51.88	\$ 9.84	\$ 39.36	\$ 7.35	\$ 29.40	\$ 10.88	\$ 43.52	\$ 9.85	\$ 39.40	\$ 9.85	\$ 39.40
	8	Xlarge	\$ 12.97	\$ 103.76	\$ 9.84	\$ 78.72	\$ 7.35	\$ 58.80	\$ 10.88	\$ 87.04	\$ 9.85	\$ 78.80	\$ 9.85	\$ 78.80
				<b>\$ 155.64</b>		<b>\$ 118.08</b>		<b>\$ 88.20</b>		<b>\$ 130.56</b>		<b>\$ 118.20</b>		<b>\$ 118.20</b>
Fair Board Shirts														
	2	Small	\$ 12.97	\$ 25.94	\$ 9.15	\$ 18.30	\$ 8.40	\$ 16.80	\$ 8.39	\$ 16.78	\$ 9.12	\$ 18.24	\$ 7.93	\$ 15.86
	3	Medium	\$ 12.97	\$ 38.91	\$ 9.15	\$ 27.45	\$ 8.40	\$ 25.20	\$ 8.39	\$ 25.17	\$ 9.12	\$ 27.36	\$ 7.93	\$ 23.79
	5	Large	\$ 12.97	\$ 64.85	\$ 9.15	\$ 45.75	\$ 8.40	\$ 42.00	\$ 8.39	\$ 41.95	\$ 9.12	\$ 45.60	\$ 7.93	\$ 39.65
	5	Xlarge	\$ 12.97	\$ 64.85	\$ 9.15	\$ 45.75	\$ 8.40	\$ 42.00	\$ 8.39	\$ 41.95	\$ 9.12	\$ 45.60	\$ 7.93	\$ 39.65
	1	XXLarge	\$ 16.00	\$ 16.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 8.40	\$ 8.40	\$ 8.39	\$ 8.39	\$ 9.12	\$ 9.12	\$ 7.93	\$ 7.93
				<b>\$ 210.55</b>		<b>\$ 148.25</b>		<b>\$ 134.40</b>		<b>\$ 134.24</b>		<b>\$ 145.92</b>		<b>\$ 126.88</b>
Fair Board Shirts Superintendents														
	11	Small	\$ 12.97	\$ 142.67	\$ 9.15	\$ 100.65	\$ 8.40	\$ 92.40	\$ 8.39	\$ 92.29	\$ 9.12	\$ 100.32	\$ 7.93	\$ 87.23
	16	Medium	\$ 12.97	\$ 207.52	\$ 9.15	\$ 146.40	\$ 8.40	\$ 134.40	\$ 8.39	\$ 134.24	\$ 9.12	\$ 145.92	\$ 7.93	\$ 126.88
	16	Large	\$ 12.97	\$ 207.52	\$ 9.15	\$ 146.40	\$ 8.40	\$ 134.40	\$ 8.39	\$ 134.24	\$ 9.12	\$ 145.92	\$ 7.93	\$ 126.88
	19	Xlarge	\$ 12.97	\$ 246.43	\$ 9.15	\$ 173.85	\$ 8.40	\$ 159.60	\$ 8.39	\$ 159.41	\$ 9.12	\$ 173.28	\$ 7.93	\$ 150.67
	5	XXLarge	\$ 16.00	\$ 80.00	\$ 11.00	\$ 55.00	\$ 8.40	\$ 42.00	\$ 8.39	\$ 41.95	\$ 9.12	\$ 45.60	\$ 7.93	\$ 39.65
				<b>\$ 884.14</b>		<b>\$ 622.30</b>		<b>\$ 562.80</b>		<b>\$ 562.13</b>		<b>\$ 611.04</b>		<b>\$ 531.31</b>
Shipping			\$ 125.00	\$ 150.00										
Set-up														
Total of each			\$ 598.62	\$ 9,083.92	\$ 382.88	\$ 11,978.63	\$ 247.66	\$ 5,310.61	\$ 316.39	\$ 7,742.16	\$ 337.26	\$ 8,389.00	\$ 292.27	\$ 6,623.12

Sun State Marking 12 days		Impress Ink 19-Jun-15		Custom Innovations 3 weeks		Custom Innovations Alternate bid Port & Co.		Tower Sports 8 days		Tower Sports Alternate bid		NX Level 20-Jul-15	
each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total
\$ 9.65	\$ 115.80	\$ 6.75	\$ 81.00	\$ 9.99	\$ 119.88	\$ 9.99	\$ 99.90	\$ 6.18	\$ 74.16	\$ 6.18	\$ 61.80	\$ 6.25	\$ 75.00
\$ 9.65	\$ 125.45	\$ 6.75	\$ 87.75	\$ 9.99	\$ 129.87	\$ 9.99	\$ 99.90	\$ 6.18	\$ 80.34	\$ 6.18	\$ 61.80	\$ 6.25	\$ 81.25
\$ 9.65	\$ 115.80	\$ 6.75	\$ 81.00	\$ 9.99	\$ 119.88	\$ 9.99	\$ 99.90	\$ 6.18	\$ 74.16	\$ 6.18	\$ 61.80	\$ 6.25	\$ 75.00
\$ 9.65	\$ 19.30	\$ 6.75	\$ 13.50	\$ 12.20	\$ 24.40	\$ 12.20	\$ 122.00	\$ 7.80	\$ 15.60	\$ 7.80	\$ 78.00	\$ 6.25	\$ 12.50
	<b>\$ 376.35</b>		<b>\$ 263.25</b>		<b>\$ 394.03</b>		<b>\$ 421.70</b>		<b>\$ 244.26</b>		<b>\$ 263.40</b>		<b>\$ 243.75</b>
\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 6.75	\$ 13.50	\$ 6.68	\$ 13.36	\$ 6.68	\$ 51.10	\$ 4.80	\$ 9.60	\$ 4.65	\$ 9.30	\$ 6.25	\$ 12.50
\$ 7.50	\$ 52.50	\$ 6.75	\$ 47.25	\$ 6.68	\$ 46.76	\$ 6.68	\$ 51.10	\$ 4.80	\$ 33.60	\$ 4.65	\$ 32.55	\$ 6.25	\$ 43.75
\$ 7.50	\$ 30.00	\$ 6.75	\$ 27.00	\$ 6.68	\$ 26.72	\$ 6.68	\$ 51.10	\$ 4.80	\$ 19.20	\$ 4.65	\$ 18.60	\$ 6.25	\$ 25.00
\$ 7.50	\$ 15.00	\$ 6.75	\$ 13.50	\$ 8.99	\$ 17.98	\$ 8.99	\$ 68.77	\$ 7.28	\$ 14.56	\$ 6.94	\$ 13.88	\$ 6.25	\$ 12.50
	<b>\$ 112.50</b>		<b>\$ 101.25</b>		<b>\$ 104.82</b>		<b>\$ 222.08</b>		<b>\$ 76.96</b>		<b>\$ 74.33</b>		<b>\$ 93.75</b>
\$ 12.20	\$ 48.80	\$ 8.98	\$ 35.92	\$ 9.26	\$ 37.04	\$ 9.26	\$ 120.10	\$ 5.74	\$ 22.96	\$ 5.74	\$ 74.45	\$ 12.00	\$ 48.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 195.20	\$ 8.98	\$ 143.68	\$ 9.26	\$ 148.16	\$ 9.26	\$ 120.10	\$ 5.74	\$ 91.84	\$ 5.74	\$ 74.45	\$ 12.00	\$ 192.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 122.00	\$ 8.98	\$ 89.80	\$ 9.26	\$ 92.60	\$ 9.26	\$ 120.10	\$ 5.74	\$ 57.40	\$ 5.74	\$ 74.45	\$ 12.00	\$ 120.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 268.40	\$ 8.98	\$ 197.56	\$ 9.26	\$ 203.72	\$ 9.26	\$ 120.10	\$ 5.74	\$ 126.28	\$ 5.74	\$ 74.45	\$ 12.00	\$ 264.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 24.40	\$ 8.98	\$ 17.96	\$ 12.91	\$ 25.82	\$ 12.91	\$ 206.56	\$ 7.74	\$ 15.48	\$ 7.74	\$ 123.84	\$ 12.00	\$ 24.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 12.20	\$ 8.98	\$ 8.98	\$ 13.27	\$ 13.27	\$ 13.27	\$ 212.32	\$ 8.74	\$ 8.74	\$ 8.74	\$ 139.84	\$ 12.00	\$ 12.00
	<b>\$ 671.00</b>		<b>\$ 493.90</b>		<b>\$ 520.61</b>		<b>\$ 899.29</b>		<b>\$ 322.70</b>		<b>\$ 561.47</b>		<b>\$ 660.00</b>
\$ 26.75	\$ 53.50	\$ 15.75	\$ 31.50	\$ 17.20	\$ 34.40	\$ 17.20	\$ 369.80	\$ 11.94	\$ 23.88	\$ 11.94	\$ 256.71	\$ 17.00	\$ 34.00
\$ 26.75	\$ 374.50	\$ 15.75	\$ 220.50	\$ 17.20	\$ 240.80	\$ 17.20	\$ 369.80	\$ 11.94	\$ 167.16	\$ 11.94	\$ 256.71	\$ 17.00	\$ 238.00
\$ 26.75	\$ 321.00	\$ 15.75	\$ 189.00	\$ 17.20	\$ 206.40	\$ 17.20	\$ 369.80	\$ 11.94	\$ 143.28	\$ 11.94	\$ 256.71	\$ 17.00	\$ 204.00
\$ 26.75	\$ 374.50	\$ 15.75	\$ 220.50	\$ 17.20	\$ 240.80	\$ 17.20	\$ 369.80	\$ 11.94	\$ 167.16	\$ 11.94	\$ 256.71	\$ 17.00	\$ 238.00
\$ 26.75	\$ 80.25	\$ 15.75	\$ 47.25	\$ 20.20	\$ 60.60	\$ 20.20	\$ 434.30	\$ 12.94	\$ 38.82	\$ 12.94	\$ 278.21	\$ 17.00	\$ 51.00
	<b>\$ 1,203.75</b>		<b>\$ 708.75</b>		<b>\$ 783.00</b>		<b>\$ 1,913.50</b>		<b>\$ 540.30</b>		<b>\$ 1,305.05</b>		<b>\$ 765.00</b>
\$ 3.80	\$ 1,140.00	\$ 3.45	\$ 1,035.00	\$ 3.20	\$ 960.00	\$ 3.07	\$ 921.00	\$ 3.65	\$ 1,095.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 3.30	\$ 990.00
\$ 3.80	\$ 1,520.00	\$ 3.45	\$ 1,380.00	\$ 3.20	\$ 1,280.00	\$ 3.07	\$ 1,228.00	\$ 3.65	\$ 1,460.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 3.30	\$ 1,320.00
\$ 3.80	\$ 950.00	\$ 3.45	\$ 862.50	\$ 3.20	\$ 800.00	\$ 3.07	\$ 767.50	\$ 3.65	\$ 912.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 3.30	\$ 825.00
\$ 3.80	\$ 950.00	\$ 3.45	\$ 862.50	\$ 3.20	\$ 800.00	\$ 3.07	\$ 767.50	\$ 3.65	\$ 912.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 3.30	\$ 825.00
\$ 3.80	\$ 95.00	\$ 3.45	\$ 86.25	\$ 5.76	\$ 144.00	\$ 5.63	\$ 140.75	\$ 6.13	\$ 153.25	\$ 5.79	\$ 144.75	\$ 3.30	\$ 82.50
\$ 3.80	\$ 76.00	\$ 3.45	\$ 69.00	\$ 7.56	\$ 151.20	\$ 7.43	\$ 148.60	\$ 6.23	\$ 124.60	\$ 5.89	\$ 117.80	\$ 3.30	\$ 66.00
	<b>\$ 4,731.00</b>		<b>\$ 4,295.25</b>	add usher \$ 2.23 per shirt		<b>\$ 3,973.35</b>	add usher \$ 0.95 per shirt		<b>\$ 4,462.55</b>		<b>\$ 4,108.50</b>		<b>\$ 4,108.50</b>
				add super \$ 2.70 per shirt			add super \$ 0.95 per shirt						

\$ 4,135.20

\$ 4,657.85

\$ 3.80	\$ 152.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 159.20	\$ 3.26	\$ 130.40	\$ 3.26	\$ 18.09	\$ 3.80	\$ 152.00	\$ 3.78	\$ 151.20	\$ 3.20	\$ 128.00
\$ 3.80	\$ 228.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 238.80	\$ 3.26	\$ 195.60	\$ 3.26	\$ 18.09	\$ 3.80	\$ 228.00	\$ 3.78	\$ 226.80	\$ 3.20	\$ 192.00
\$ 3.80	\$ 228.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 238.80	\$ 3.26	\$ 195.60	\$ 3.26	\$ 18.09	\$ 3.80	\$ 228.00	\$ 3.78	\$ 226.80	\$ 3.20	\$ 192.00
\$ 3.80	\$ 152.00	\$ 3.98	\$ 159.20	\$ 3.26	\$ 130.40	\$ 3.26	\$ 18.09	\$ 3.80	\$ 152.00	\$ 3.78	\$ 151.20	\$ 3.20	\$ 128.00
	<b>\$ 760.00</b>		<b>\$ 796.00</b>		<b>\$ 652.00</b>		<b>\$ 72.37</b>		<b>\$ 760.00</b>		<b>\$ 756.00</b>		<b>\$ 640.00</b>

\$ 13.00	\$ 52.00	\$ 9.97	\$ 39.88	\$ 12.45	\$ 49.80	\$ 12.45	\$ 161.48	\$ 6.04	\$ 24.16	P&C	\$ 5.44	\$ 21.76	\$ 12.00	\$ 48.00
\$ 13.00	\$ 104.00	\$ 9.97	\$ 79.76	\$ 12.45	\$ 99.60	\$ 12.45	\$ 161.48	\$ 6.04	\$ 48.32		\$ 5.44	\$ 43.52	\$ 12.00	\$ 96.00
	<b>\$ 156.00</b>		<b>\$ 119.64</b>		<b>\$ 149.40</b>		<b>\$ 322.95</b>		<b>\$ 72.48</b>			<b>\$ 65.28</b>		<b>\$ 144.00</b>

\$ 12.20	\$ 24.40	\$ 8.98	\$ 17.96	\$ 9.77	\$ 19.54	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 12.48	P&C	\$ 5.74	\$ 11.48	\$ 11.00	\$ 22.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 36.60	\$ 8.98	\$ 26.94	\$ 9.77	\$ 29.31	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 18.72		\$ 5.74	\$ 17.22	\$ 11.00	\$ 33.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 61.00	\$ 8.98	\$ 44.90	\$ 9.77	\$ 48.85	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 31.20		\$ 5.74	\$ 28.70	\$ 11.00	\$ 55.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 61.00	\$ 8.98	\$ 44.90	\$ 9.77	\$ 48.85	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 31.20		\$ 5.74	\$ 28.70	\$ 11.00	\$ 55.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 12.20	\$ 8.98	\$ 8.98	\$ 13.42	\$ 13.42	\$ 13.42	\$ 214.72	\$ 8.38	\$ 8.38		\$ 7.74	\$ 7.74	\$ 11.00	\$ 11.00
	<b>\$ 195.20</b>		<b>\$ 143.68</b>		<b>\$ 159.97</b>		<b>\$ 721.59</b>		<b>\$ 101.98</b>			<b>\$ 93.84</b>		<b>\$ 176.00</b>

\$ 12.20	\$ 134.20	\$ 8.98	\$ 98.78	\$ 9.77	\$ 107.47	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 68.64	P&C	\$ 5.74	\$ 63.14	\$ 11.00	\$ 121.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 195.20	\$ 8.98	\$ 143.68	\$ 9.77	\$ 156.32	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 99.84		\$ 5.74	\$ 91.84	\$ 11.00	\$ 176.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 195.20	\$ 8.98	\$ 143.68	\$ 9.77	\$ 156.32	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 99.84		\$ 5.74	\$ 91.84	\$ 11.00	\$ 176.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 231.80	\$ 8.98	\$ 170.62	\$ 9.77	\$ 185.63	\$ 9.77	\$ 126.72	\$ 6.24	\$ 118.56		\$ 5.74	\$ 109.06	\$ 11.00	\$ 209.00
\$ 12.20	\$ 61.00	\$ 8.98	\$ 44.90	\$ 13.42	\$ 67.10	\$ 13.42	\$ 214.72	\$ 8.38	\$ 41.90		\$ 7.74	\$ 38.70	\$ 11.00	\$ 55.00
	<b>\$ 817.40</b>		<b>\$ 601.66</b>		<b>\$ 672.84</b>		<b>\$ 721.59</b>		<b>\$ 428.78</b>			<b>\$ 394.58</b>		<b>\$ 737.00</b>

\$ 461.55	\$ 9,023.20	\$ 332.99	\$ 7,523.38	\$ 397.41	\$ 7,571.87	\$ 391.70	\$ 9,268.42	\$ 270.98	\$ 7,571.87	\$ 260.45	\$ 7,976.50	\$ 373.60	\$ 7,568.00
-----------	-------------	-----------	-------------	-----------	-------------	-----------	-------------	-----------	-------------	-----------	-------------	-----------	-------------

Affordable Printing 2 weeks		IC Group		Florida Embroidery 10 bus days		Henderson Advertising 14-Jun-15		Splash Promo Spc 15 working days		UCI 21 days		Succeed Printing 5-10 working days		AD Wear 10 busines
each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each	total	each
\$ 9.49	\$ 113.88	\$ 8.55	\$ 102.60	\$ 6.06	\$ 72.72	\$ 11.90	\$ 142.80	\$ 7.15	\$ 85.80	\$ 9.25	\$ 111.00	\$ 8.80	\$ 105.60	\$ 8.68
\$ 9.49	\$ 123.37	\$ 8.55	\$ 111.15	\$ 6.06	\$ 78.78	\$ 11.90	\$ 154.70	\$ 7.15	\$ 92.95	\$ 9.25	\$ 120.25	\$ 8.80	\$ 114.40	\$ 8.68
\$ 9.49	\$ 113.88	\$ 8.55	\$ 102.60	\$ 6.06	\$ 72.72	\$ 11.90	\$ 142.80	\$ 7.15	\$ 85.80	\$ 9.25	\$ 111.00	\$ 8.80	\$ 105.60	\$ 8.68
\$ 9.49	\$ 18.98	\$ 8.55	\$ 17.10	\$ 6.06	\$ 12.12	\$ 11.90	\$ 23.80	\$ 7.15	\$ 14.30	\$ 11.20	\$ 22.40	\$ 8.80	\$ 17.60	\$ 8.68
	<b>\$ 370.11</b>		<b>\$ 333.45</b>		<b>\$ 236.34</b>		<b>\$ 464.10</b>		<b>\$ 278.85</b>		<b>\$ 364.65</b>		<b>\$ 343.20</b>	
\$ 8.16	\$ 16.32	\$ 7.70	\$ 15.40	\$ 6.06	\$ 12.12	\$ 12.90	\$ 25.80	\$ 7.15	\$ 14.30	\$ 6.65	\$ 13.30	\$ 6.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 8.93
\$ 8.16	\$ 57.12	\$ 7.70	\$ 53.90	\$ 6.06	\$ 42.42	\$ 12.90	\$ 90.30	\$ 7.15	\$ 50.05	\$ 6.65	\$ 46.55	\$ 6.00	\$ 42.00	\$ 8.93
\$ 8.16	\$ 32.64	\$ 7.70	\$ 30.80	\$ 6.06	\$ 24.24	\$ 12.90	\$ 51.60	\$ 7.15	\$ 28.60	\$ 6.65	\$ 26.60	\$ 6.00	\$ 24.00	\$ 8.93
\$ 8.16	\$ 16.32	\$ 7.70	\$ 15.40	\$ 6.06	\$ 12.12	\$ 12.90	\$ 25.80	\$ 7.15	\$ 14.30	\$ 8.60	\$ 17.20	\$ 6.00	\$ 12.00	\$ 8.93
	<b>\$ 122.40</b>		<b>\$ 115.50</b>		<b>\$ 90.90</b>		<b>\$ 193.50</b>		<b>\$ 107.25</b>		<b>\$ 103.65</b>		<b>\$ 90.00</b>	
\$ 9.52	\$ 38.08	\$ 10.92	\$ 43.68	\$ 6.72	\$ 26.88	\$ 12.90	\$ 51.60	\$ 10.50	\$ 42.00	\$ 11.85	\$ 47.40	\$ 9.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 10.62
\$ 9.52	\$ 152.32	\$ 10.92	\$ 174.72	\$ 6.72	\$ 107.52	\$ 12.90	\$ 206.40	\$ 10.50	\$ 168.00	\$ 11.85	\$ 189.60	\$ 9.00	\$ 144.00	\$ 10.62
\$ 9.52	\$ 95.20	\$ 10.92	\$ 109.20	\$ 6.72	\$ 67.20	\$ 12.90	\$ 129.00	\$ 10.50	\$ 105.00	\$ 11.85	\$ 118.50	\$ 9.00	\$ 90.00	\$ 10.62
\$ 9.52	\$ 209.44	\$ 10.92	\$ 240.24	\$ 6.72	\$ 147.84	\$ 12.90	\$ 283.80	\$ 10.50	\$ 231.00	\$ 11.85	\$ 260.70	\$ 9.00	\$ 198.00	\$ 10.62
\$ 9.52	\$ 19.04	\$ 10.92	\$ 21.84	\$ 6.72	\$ 13.44	\$ 12.90	\$ 25.80	\$ 10.50	\$ 21.00	\$ 11.85	\$ 23.70	\$ 9.00	\$ 18.00	\$ 10.62
\$ 9.52	\$ 9.52	\$ 10.92	\$ 10.92	\$ 6.72	\$ 6.72	\$ 12.90	\$ 12.90	\$ 10.50	\$ 10.50	\$ 15.39	\$ 15.39	\$ 9.00	\$ 9.00	\$ 10.62
	<b>\$ 523.60</b>		<b>\$ 600.60</b>		<b>\$ 369.60</b>		<b>\$ 709.50</b>		<b>\$ 577.50</b>		<b>\$ 655.29</b>		<b>\$ 495.00</b>	
\$ 9.53	\$ 19.06	NO BID		\$ 15.98	\$ 31.96	\$ 27.90	\$ 55.80	\$ 18.50	\$ 37.00	\$ 17.04	\$ 34.08	\$ 18.00	\$ 36.00	\$ 20.92
\$ 9.53	\$ 133.42	NO BID		\$ 15.98	\$ 223.72	\$ 27.90	\$ 390.60	\$ 18.50	\$ 259.00	\$ 17.04	\$ 238.56	\$ 18.00	\$ 252.00	\$ 20.92
\$ 9.53	\$ 114.36	NO BID		\$ 15.98	\$ 191.76	\$ 27.90	\$ 334.80	\$ 18.50	\$ 222.00	\$ 17.04	\$ 204.48	\$ 18.00	\$ 216.00	\$ 20.92
\$ 9.53	\$ 133.42	NO BID		\$ 15.98	\$ 223.72	\$ 27.90	\$ 390.60	\$ 18.50	\$ 259.00	\$ 17.04	\$ 238.56	\$ 18.00	\$ 252.00	\$ 20.92
\$ 9.53	\$ 28.59	NO BID		\$ 15.98	\$ 47.94	\$ 27.90	\$ 83.70	\$ 18.50	\$ 55.50	\$ 18.34	\$ 55.02	\$ 18.00	\$ 54.00	\$ 20.92
	<b>\$ 428.85</b>				<b>\$ 719.10</b>		<b>\$ 1,255.50</b>		<b>\$ 832.50</b>		<b>\$ 770.70</b>		<b>\$ 810.00</b>	
\$ 3.71	\$ 1,113.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,050.00	\$ 4.17	\$ 1,251.00	\$ 7.30	\$ 2,190.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 1,350.00	\$ 3.88
\$ 3.71	\$ 1,484.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 1,400.00	\$ 4.17	\$ 1,668.00	\$ 7.30	\$ 2,920.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 3.88
\$ 3.71	\$ 927.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 4.17	\$ 1,042.50	\$ 7.30	\$ 1,825.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 1,125.00	\$ 3.88
\$ 3.71	\$ 927.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 875.00	\$ 4.17	\$ 1,042.50	\$ 7.30	\$ 1,825.00	\$ 1.00	\$ 250.00	\$ 3.88
\$ 3.71	\$ 92.75	\$ 3.50	\$ 87.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 87.50	\$ 3.50	\$ 87.50	\$ 4.17	\$ 104.25	\$ 7.30	\$ 182.50	\$ 4.50	\$ 112.50	\$ 3.88
\$ 3.71	\$ 74.20	\$ 3.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 3.50	\$ 70.00	\$ 4.17	\$ 83.40	\$ 9.38	\$ 187.60	\$ 4.50	\$ 90.00	\$ 3.88
	<b>\$ 4,618.95</b>		<b>\$ 4,357.50</b>		<b>\$ 4,357.50</b>		<b>\$ 4,357.50</b>		<b>\$ 5,191.65</b>		<b>\$ 9,130.10</b>		<b>\$ 4,727.50</b>	



Logos

is days

total		each	total
\$ 104.16		\$ 8.52	\$ 102.24
\$ 112.84		\$ 8.52	\$ 110.76
\$ 104.16		\$ 8.52	\$ 102.24
\$ 17.36		\$ 10.52	\$ 21.04
<b>\$ 338.52</b>	Back	\$ 1.65	per shirt
			<b>\$ 336.28</b>

\$ 17.86		\$ 5.47	\$ 10.94
\$ 62.51		\$ 5.47	\$ 38.29
\$ 35.72		\$ 5.47	\$ 21.88
\$ 17.86		\$ 7.47	\$ 14.94
<b>\$ 133.95</b>	Back	\$ 1.65	per shirt
			<b>\$ 86.05</b>

\$ 42.48		\$ 11.25	\$ 45.00
\$ 169.92		\$ 11.25	\$ 180.00
\$ 106.20		\$ 11.25	\$ 112.50
\$ 233.64		\$ 11.25	\$ 247.50
\$ 21.24		\$ 13.25	\$ 26.50
\$ 10.62		\$ 13.25	\$ 13.25
<b>\$ 584.10</b>			<b>\$ 624.75</b>

\$ 41.84		\$ 19.00	\$ 38.00
\$ 292.88		\$ 19.00	\$ 266.00
\$ 251.04		\$ 19.00	\$ 228.00
\$ 292.88		\$ 19.00	\$ 266.00
\$ 62.76		\$ 21.00	\$ 63.00
<b>\$ 941.40</b>			<b>\$ 861.00</b>

\$ 1,164.00		\$ 4.27	\$ 1,281.00
\$ 1,552.00		\$ 4.27	\$ 1,708.00
\$ 970.00		\$ 4.27	\$ 1,067.50
\$ 970.00		\$ 4.27	\$ 1,067.50
\$ 97.00		\$ 6.27	\$ 156.75
\$ 77.60		\$ 6.27	\$ 125.40
<b>\$ 4,830.60</b>	add usher	\$ 1.60	per shirt
	add super	\$ 1.60	per shirt

\$ 5,406.15

\$ 148.80	\$ 4.75	\$ 190.00
\$ 223.20	\$ 4.75	\$ 285.00
\$ 223.20	\$ 4.75	\$ 285.00
\$ 148.80	\$ 4.75	\$ 190.00
<b>\$ 744.00</b>		<b>\$ 950.00</b>

\$ 48.88	\$ 8.85	\$ 35.40
\$ 97.76	\$ 8.85	\$ 70.80
<b>\$ 146.64</b>		<b>\$ 106.20</b>

\$ 21.56	\$ 11.25	\$ 22.50
\$ 32.34	\$ 11.25	\$ 33.75
\$ 53.90	\$ 11.25	\$ 56.25
\$ 53.90	\$ 11.25	\$ 56.25
\$ 10.78	\$ 12.25	\$ 12.25
<b>\$ 172.48</b>		<b>\$ 181.00</b>

\$ 118.58	\$ 11.25	\$ 123.75
\$ 172.48	\$ 11.25	\$ 180.00
\$ 172.48	\$ 11.25	\$ 180.00
\$ 204.82	\$ 11.25	\$ 213.75
\$ 53.90	\$ 12.25	\$ 61.25
<b>\$ 722.26</b>		<b>\$ 758.75</b>

		\$ 320.00
\$ 8,613.95	\$ 415.78	